
Step 5 – Part B – Display Detail Options 

• Below is an Image of the Show details that shows 
the options.  Next, I will show you each one of 
them.  First is All details. 

 



• If you are not on the View page, click on the 
View Tab.  Also click on a Folder 



• Typical default is File name and you see the 
file name under each photo.  Next is All 
details. 



• Whey you click on All details, you see the 
details next to the photos.  Next explains the 
details. 



• First is the file name. 

• Second is Date taken. 

• Third is file size. 

• Forth is image size. 

• Fifth is rating. 

• Note – it does not 
show date modified. 

• Next is file size only. 



• Whey you click on File size, you see the file 
size only.  Next is Date taken. 



• Whey you click on File size, you see the file 
size only.  Next is Date taken.  Next is Date 
modified. 



• You see the first photo was modified, which 
is edit.  All others show Date taken.  Next is 
Image size. 



• When you click on Image size, you see the 
size of the photos.  Next is Rating. 



• When you click on Rating, you see type of 
Rating, which here is blank.  Next is a sample 
of different Rating.  To Rate is Step 3 – Part E. 



• You see a 3 star sample.  Next is Caption. 



• When you click on Caption, you don’t see 
Caption and it says Add Caption.  Step 3 – 
Part C show you how to Add Caption. Next is 
a sample. 



• Here is the sample.  Next is Flags. 



• When you click on Flags, sometimes you 
don’t see them.  Step 3 – Part F shows you 
how to Flag.  Next is a sample of a Flag. 



• Here is a Flag sample.  Note – you also see 
Caption that was clicked on.  This is the end 
of Part B. 


